Chapter 32 — Plumbing

§ 32-101
§ 32-102

§ 32-201
§ 32-202
§ 32-203
§ 32-204
§ 32-205
§ 32-206
§ 32-207
§ 32-208
§ 32-209
§ 32-210
§ 32-211
§ 32-212
§ 32-213
§ 32-214
§ 32-215
§ 32-216
§ 32-217
§ 32-218
§ 32-219
§ 32-220
§ 32-221
§ 32-222

§ 32-223

§ 32-224

§ 32-225

§ 32-226
§ 32-227

Articlel — In General

S a1 G I {1 TSR 32-4
F Yo (0] o] (] o APPSR 32-4

Article I — Modifications of National Code

IN GENETAL....coiiieeiteeti e e e 32-4
Name of JUFSAICHION. ......cociieerieeereee e 32-4
Pre-existing USE........ocv e 32-5
Code OFfiCial......eeireeerireeieese e e e 32-5
Appointment of Plumbing INSPector. .........ccoccvveiieiiieeniee e 32-5
Permit REQUIred. .......ocvv e 32-5
Person to Apply for Plumbing Permit. ........ccccoooviinncenecnececnee 32-6
Fee Schedule. ... 32-6
Prompt Compliance with Violation Notices. ..........cccoovevreniircennnen. 32-7
Penalties........oooviiiiie s 32-8
Continuance of Work After Stop Work Order.........cccooevvrieieennenne 32-8
Membership of Board of Appeals. ........cccveeririiieenienieneeseeeenen 32-8
Qualification for Members of the Board of Appeals........c..cccoceernene 32-9
Definition of Plumbing Fixture. .........cccccovviiiiinieeneceee e 32-9
Additional Definitions. ........cccooiieeiie e 32-9
Availability of Public System..........cccoireiieniiiiee e 32-10
Protection of Pipes From Freezing..........cccocveeverivienenieieennenne 32-10
Sewer Depth. .....ooevi e 32-11
Water Service PIPe. ...cocv i 32-11
Permitted Water Service Pipe Materials. ...........ccccveninivieenene 32-11
Permitted Water Distribution Pipe Materials. ............cccoovivreenenne 32-12
Permitted Sanitary Drainage and Vent Piping Materials for

Above Ground Installation. ..........cccceeireieninner e 32-12
Permitted Sanitary Drainage and Vent Piping Materials for
Underground Installation............cccveevieeniniineesec e 32-13
Permitted Sanitary Drainage Piping Materials for the

BUIlAING SEWET. ..o e 32-14
Connection of the Building Sewer or Lateral to Sewer

MaIN PIPE. oo 32-14
Building (HOUSE) Traps. ...ccveoviieerriree e e 32-15
Location of Building Sewer Cleanouts. ..........cccccvevreeneeieieenenns 32-15

32-2



§ 32-228
§ 32-229
§ 32-230
§ 32-231

§ 32-301
§ 32-302
§ 32-303
§ 32-304
§ 32-305
§ 32-306
§ 32-307

§ 32-401
§ 32-402
§ 32-403

q32-A
q32-B
q32-C
32-D

q32-E
q 32-F
132G

q32-H
321

PLUMBING
Size Of FIOOr DIaiNS. ....cooeeevieeeeee ettt e s 32-15
No Floor Drains Below Grade. ........ccccceeeeeicvvieeeeeeceeeieeeee e 32-16
Floor Drains In Rooms With Urinals..........cccooeeeeeiieeciieeeee e 32-16
Size of Water Service Pipe........cccooviiiiiienine e 32-16

Article Il — DRBC Minimum
Water Conservation Performance Standards

1o C 1=t LT | PSPPSR 32-16
General PONCY. ......ccoiiiiieeee e s 32-17
Approval of UNNaIS.......ccoooeiieeiiicieeeee e 32-17
Approval of Water ClOSets. .........ccveerireineenee e 32-17
Maximum Flow of Building Water Distribution Sysetm................. 32-17
Special Purpose EQUIPMENT. .........cooiiiiiieiee e 32-18
EXEMPLIONS. ..o e 32-18

Article IV — Additional Borough Requirements

Reports 10 BOroUGh. ........cociriieeniec e 32-18
Prohibited WOrK.........ocvieeiieieeec e 32-19
Violations and Penalties. .........ccoccieiieiinene e 32-19
Appendix

Disposition of Ordinance 275. ........cccieeiieieieeneee e 32-19
Disposition of Ordinance 291. .......cccieeiirieneereee e 32-19
Disposition of Ordinance 342, § 9. ......ccccorevreeririe e 32-20
Disposition of 1981 Code, Chapter 133, Atrticle VIl

(derived from Ordinance 203)........ccccvieererneereenenreseesre e 32-20
Source OrdiNAnCES. ........cceueeerireereeni e e 32-20
Prior Ordinances Concerning Related Subject Matter. ................ 32-21
Disposition of Ordinance 199 to Chapter 92 of the 1981

Code (before Ord. 275).....ccueciieerierineeneesre e 32-21
Sealtite Sewer Pipe Saddles Drawing R-3409-D2. ...........c.cc..... 32-23

Schematic Diagram of House Traps. .......cccoovvevreeninieneeneneennens 32-24

32-3



32-4 LAND USE & DEVELOPMENT; STRUCTURES pt. IIT

Article| — In General

§ 32-101  Short Title.

This Chapter shall be known, and may be cited, as the “Plumbing Code of the Borough of
Alburtis.”

§ 32-102  Adoption.

A certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the Secretary of
the Borough of Alburtis, being marked and designated as “The BOCA National Plumbing Code,
Eighth Edition, 1990” as published by the Building Officials and Code Administrators Interna-
tional, Inc. (and incorporated herein by reference), and as modified by the additions, insertions,
deletions, and changes set forth in Articles II, III, and IV, is hereby adopted as the Building Code
of the Borough of Alburtis, Lehigh County, Pennsylvania.

Article I — Modifications of National Code

§ 32-201 In General.

The 1990 BOCA National Plumbing Code is modified for purposes of the Plumbing Code
of Borough of Alburtis as set forth in the remaining sections of this Article II (with insertions

indicated by double underlining and deletions indicated by stricken-threugh type).

§ 32-202 Name of Jurisdiction.

P-100.1 (relating to Administration and Enforcement— General —Title) is modified as
follows:

These regulations shall be known as the Plumbing Code of BNAME-OFJURIS-
pieront the Borough of Alburtis, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”



Ch. 32 PLUMBING 32-5

§ 32-203  Pre-existing Use.

P-104.1 (relating to Administration and Enforcement—EXxisting Use — Continuation) is
modified as follows:

The legal use and occupancy of any structure existing on {BATE-OF-ADOPTON-OF
THIS-€obE]} April 25, 1990, or for which it had been heretofore approved, shall be

continued without change except as shall be specifically covered in this code.

§ 32-204  Code Official.

P-109.1 (relating to Administration and Enforcement—Code Official —General) is modi-
fied as follows:

The department-of plumbinginspeection position of Plumbing Inspector is hereby
created and the exeeutive-official-in-change-thereof Plumbing Inspector shall be

designated the code official for the purposes of this code.

§ 32-205  Appointment of Plumbing Inspector.

P-109.2 (relating to Administration and Enforcement—Code Official — Appointment) is
modified as follows:

The eede-official Plumbing Inspector shall be appointed by the ehief-appeointing
autherity-of thejurisdiction Borough Council of the Borough of Alburtis. To be
eligible for appointment to the position of Plumbing Inspector, the person shall be

qualified as a Master Plumber in accordance with this code. Such official shall not
be removed from office except for cause and after full opportunity has been

granted on specific and relevant charges by and before the appeintingauthority
Borough Council of the Borough of Alburtis.

§ 32-206 Permit Required.

P-111.1 (relating to Administration and Enforcement— Application for Permit— Permit
required) is modified as follows:

Plumbing work shall not be commenced until a permit for such work has been is-
sued by the code official. A permit is not required for repairs which involve only
the working parts of a faucet or valve, clearance of stoppages, or repairing or re-
placement of defective faucets or valves, provided alterations are not made in the

existing piping or fixtures. Plumbing work which requires a permit shall include,
without limitation, new installations, alterations, fixture replacement, sanitary and
storm sewer drainage, sanitary facilities, water supplies, storm water and sewage
disposal in buildings, water supply and drainage connections to refrigeration proc-
esses and comfort cooling, water supply and drainage connections to building



32-6 LAND USE & DEVELOPMENT; STRUCTURES pt. IIT

heating, water supply and drainage connections to sprinklers and standpipes, sewer
and water lines from the curb line or property line to the building, appliances,
process piping, boiler replacements, roof drains and rain leaders.

§ 32-207  Person to Apply for Plumbing Permit.

P-111.3 (relating to Administration and Enforcement— Application for Permit—By whom
application is made) is modified as follows:

Application for a plumbing permit shall be made by the-person;-or-an-agent,toin-

stall a Master Plumber who engages in or carries on the business of installing all or
part of any plumbing system. The applicant shall meet all qualifications estab-

lished by rules promulgated with this code or by ordinance, resolution, or statute.
The full names and addresses of the owner, lessee, applicant and of the responsible
officers, if the owner or lessee is a corporate body, shall be stated in the applica-
tion.

§ 32-208 Fee Schedule.

P-114.2 (relating to Administration and Enforcement—Fees—Fee Schedule) is modified
as follows:

The permit fees for all plumbing work, reinspection fees, and license fees shall be
as indicated in the following schedule. PFORISPICHON-FOINSERT APPROPRIATE
scHEPULE] All fees are payable to the Borough of Alburtis.

P-114.1.1 Residential Dwellings.

[ =

[~ o




Ch. 32 PLUMBING 32-7

P-114.1.2 Nonresidential.

[ >

[~ o

P-114.1.3 Reinspection Fees. A reinspection fee of $30.00 may be charged
per visit for failure to have access to the job site (this includes no provision of lad-
ders where stairs are not vet installed), requesting an inspection on incomplete
work, and repeat violation visits. These fees, when assessed, will be charged to the
individual requesting the inspection and must be paid in full prior to final inspec-
tion approval.

P-114.14 License Examination and Renewal Fees. The fees for a plumb-

ing license examination (which includes the appropriate plumbing license for the
calendar year of the examination) and the fees for an annual plumbing license (for
the calendar year indicated in the application) shall be as follows:

§ 32-209  Prompt Compliance with Violation Notices.

P-117.3 (relating to Administration and Enforcement— Violations —Prosecution) is modi-
fied as follows:

If the notice of violation is not complied with premptly within five (5) working
days, the code official shall request the legal counsel of the jurisdiction to institute
the appropriate proceeding at law or in equity to restrain, correct or abate such
violation, or to require the removal or termination of the unlawful use of any
plumbing system in violation of the provisions of this code or of the order or di-
rection made pursuant thereto.




32-8 LAND USE & DEVELOPMENT; STRUCTURES pt. IIT

§ 32-210  Penalties.

P-117.4 (relating to Administration and Enforcement— Violations —Penalties) is modified
as follows:

Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with
any of the requirements thereof or who shall install plumbing work in violation of
an approved plan or directive of the code official, or of a permit or certificate is-
sued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a IPESIGNATE-OFFENSE]}
summary offense, punishable by a fire civil penalty of not more than [PESIGNATE
AMGHNT—]—deH-a%s ne Thousand Dollars gil,OOO OO) er—b§ukmpﬂsemnent—ne{—%
ATE-THVH h h-—tine—andm . Each day that a

V101at10n continues shall be deemed a separate offense

§ 32-211  Continuance of Work After Stop Work Order.

P-118.2 (relating to Administration and Enforcement— Stop Work Order —Unlawful con-
tinuance) is modified as follows:

Any person who continues any plumbing work in or about the structure after hav-
ing been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed
to perform to remove a violation or unsafe conditions, shall be liable to a fine civil
penalty of not less than {PESIGNATE-AMOUNT}-doHars One Hundred Dollars
($100.00) or more than [PESIGNATE-AMOUNT}-doHars One Thousand Dollars
($1,000.00).

§ 32-212  Membership of Board of Appeals.

P-122.2 (relating to Administration and Enforcement—Means of Appeal —Membership of
board), before P-122.2.1, is modified as follows:

The board of appeals shall consist of ﬁv&membem—appe&&ed—bﬂ%eh&eﬁap—

yeafs—eﬂ%fer—ewe—yeafs—aﬂd—eﬂ%fer—eﬂ%yeaf hree 3) members2 who shall be ap-

pointed by the Borough Council of the Borough of Alburtis at the annual reorgani-
zation meeting of the Borough Council. Fhereafter,each-new Each member will

shall serve for five-years a term of one (1) year, or until a successor has been ap-
pointed.




Ch. 32

PLUMBING

§ 32-213  Qualification for Members of the Board of Appeals.

32-9

P-122.2.1 (relating to Administration and Enforcement—Means of Appeal —Membership
of board — Qualifications) is modified as follows:

Each member shall be a licensed-professional-engineeror-architector-aplumbing

with-mechanical engineering experience resident of the Borough of Alburtis, and a
competent adult individual. In addition, the members shall preferable, but not nec-
essarily, be either licensed professional engineers, architects, contractors, or su-
perintendents of construction, with experience in either plumbing or mechanical
engineering.

§ 32-214  Definition of Plumbing Fixture.

P-201.0 (relating to Definitions— Definitions of Plumbing Terms) is modified by making
the following additions to the definition of “Plumbing fixture”:

Plumbing fixture: A receptacle or device which is either permanently or tempo-
rarily connected to the water distribution system of the premises, and demands a
supply of water therefrom; or discharges used water, waste materials, or sewage
either directly or indirectly to the drainage system of the premises; or requires both
a water supply connection and a discharge to the drainage system of the premises.
Plumbing appliances as a special class of fixture are further defined. Plumbing
fixtures shall include, without limitation, automatic clothes washers, bathtubs, bi-

dets, dishwashing machines, drinking fountains, emergency showers, eye wash
stations, floor drains, food waste grinders, garbage can washers, garbage disposals,
kitchen sinks, laundry trays, lavatories, ornamental pools, service sinks, showers,
sinks, slop sinks, special fixtures, toilets, urinals, water closets, and water coolers.

§ 32-215  Additional Definitions.

P-201.0 (relating to Definitions—Definitions of Plumbing Terms) is modified by adding
the following definitions:

Journeyman Plumber: Any person who shall have passed a Journeyman
Plumber’s examination and qualified and registered, who is the holder of a Jour-
neyman Plumber’s License, and who is employed as described in the definition of
a Master Plumber.

License Reciprocation: A Master Plumber’s License issued by any borough, city,
or township in the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania shall be accepted as proof of
qualification, and the license holder will be issued, upon payment of the license fee



32-10

LAND USE & DEVELOPMENT; STRUCTURES

as per the fee schedule, a Master Plumber’s License for the Borough of Alburtis.
Each license shall be valid for the calendar year in which it was issued, and the full
fee shall be payable, notwithstanding the actual date of issue. A Master Plumber’s
License may be suspended or revoked by the Plumbing Official, upon good cause
shown, including but not limited to the following: (1) Permitting unauthorized or
fraudulent use of the license by another; (2) Failure to file applications or certifi-
cates; (3) Performing work which fails to comply with the Plumbing Code; or (4)
Fraudulent dealing or misrepresentation.

Master Plumber: Any person or employee of a proprietorship, partnership, or
corporation which engages in or carries on the business of the plumbing trade, and
who has the final determination and the full responsibility for the manner in which
the work is done, for the materials used, and for the selection, supervision, and
control of the Journeyman Plumbers and helpers employed on the work engaged in
by said person or employee of a proprietorship, partnership, or corporation, and
who, by passing a required examination and tests, has qualified as a competent
person to be a Master Plumber. The supervisory responsibility of a Master
Plumber as defined herein may be delegated by a Master Plumber to a Journeyman
Plumber in his employ.

Master Plumber’s License: A license issued to a Master Plumber by the Bor-
ough of Alburtis.

§ 32-216  Availability of Public System.

pt. IIT

P-303.2 (relating to General Regulations—Connection to Public Water and Sewer Sys-
tem— Public systems available) is modified as follows:

A public water main or public sewer system shall be considered available to a
building when the building is located within fveMBER} Two Hundred (200) feet of
the public water main or sewer.

§ 32-217  Protection of Pipes From Freezing.

P-308.3 (relating to General Regulations —Protection of Pipes—Freezing) is modified as
follows:

Water service piping shall be installed below recorded frost penetration but not
less than [NUMBER}feet-[NUMBER]Hneches three feet zero inches (3° 0”) below
grade. In climates with freezing temperatures, plumbing piping in exterior build-
ing walls or areas subjected to freezing temperatures shall be protected against
freezing by insulation or heat or both.




Ch. 32 PLUMBING 32-11

§ 32-218  Sewer Depth.

P-308.4 (relating to General Regulations—Protection of Pipes—Sewer depth) is modified
as follows:

Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a mini-
mum of fNuMBER] thirty (30) inches below finished grade at the point of septic
tank connection. Building sewers shall be a minimum of fvoMBER] thirty (30)
inches below grade.

§ 32-219  Water Service Pipe.

P-402.4 (relating to Materials—Water Supply Piping System Materials— Water service
pipe), before Table P-402.4, is modified as follows:

Water service pipe shall conform to one of the standards listed in Table P-402.4.
All pipe or tubing, when used underground for water service and when installed
outside of the building, shall have a minimum working pressure of 160 pounds per
square inch (160 psi/1103 kPa) at 73.4 degrees F. (23 degrees C.). Where the wa-
ter pressure exceeds 160 psi (1103 kPa), piping material shall have a minimum
rated working pressure equal to the highest available pressure. Plastic-waterserv-

Sl Y B 5o

§ 32-220  Permitted Water Service Pipe Materials.

P-402.4 (relating to Materials—Water Supply Piping System Materials— Water service
pipe), Table P-402.4, is replaced with the following new Table P-402.4:

Table P-402.4
PERMITTED WATER SERVICE PIPE MATERIALS

Material Standard (see Appendix A)
Copper tube, Type K ASTM B75; ASTM B88; ASTM B251
Galvanized steel pipe ASTM A53; ASTM A120

Cast iron (ductile iron) water pipe ASTM A377, AWWA C151




32-12

§ 32-221

LAND USE & DEVELOPMENT; STRUCTURES

Permitted Water Distribution Pipe Materials.

pt. IIT

P-402.5 (relating to Materials—Water Supply Piping System Materials— Water distribu-
tion pipe), Table P-402.5, is replaced with the following new Table P-402.5:

Table P-402.5
WATER DISTRIBUTION PIPE

Material

Standard (see Appendix A)

Brass pipe

Copper or copper alloy tubing
(Types K or L, hard or soft)

Galvanized steel pipe

ASTM B43

ASTM B75; ASTM B88; ASTM B251;
ASTM B447

ASTM AS53

§ 32-222

Permitted Sanitary Drainage and Vent Piping Materials for
Above Ground Installation.

P-403.1 (relating to Materials—Sanitary Drainage and Vent Piping System Materi-
als—Above ground sanitary drainage and vent pipe), Table P-403.1, is replaced with the fol-
lowing new Table P-403.1:

Table P-403.1
PERMITTED SANITARY DRAINAGE AND VENT PIPE MATERIALS
FOR ABOVE GROUND INSTALLATION

Material

Standard (see Appendix A)

Acrylonitrile butadiene styrene
(ABS) Schedule 40 plastic pipe
(See Note a) (Type DWV)

Polyvinyl chloride (PVC) Schedule
40 plastic pipe (See Note a) (Type
DWYV)

Copper or copper alloy tube (Type
DWYV)

Cast iron pipe, bell and spigot or no
hub service weight

ASTM D2661; ASTM D2751;
ASTM F628

ASTM D2665; ASTM D2949;
ASTM F891

ASTM B75; ASTM B88; ASTM B251;
ASTM B306

ASTM A74; CISPI 301




Ch. 32 PLUMBING 32-13

§ 32-223  Permitted Sanitary Drainage and Vent Piping Materials for
Underground Installation.

P-403.2 (relating to Materials—Sanitary Drainage and Vent Piping System Materi-
als—Underground building sanitary drainage and vent pipe), Table P-403.2, is replaced with the
following new Table P-403.2:

Table P-403.2
PERMITTED SANITARY DRAINAGE AND VENT PIPE MATERIALS
FOR UNDERGROUND INSTALLATION

Material Standard (see Appendix A)
Acrylonitrile butadiene styrene ASTM D2661; ASTM D2751;
(ABS) Schedule 40 plastic pipe ASTM F628

(See Note a) (Type DWV)

Polyvinyl chloride (PVC) Schedule ASTM D2665; ASTM D2949;
40 plastic pipe (See Note a) (Type ASTM D3034; ASTM F891

DWV, SDR26, SDR35, SDR41,
PS50, or PS100)

Cast iron, service weight bell and ASTM A74; CISPI 301
spigot




32-14

§ 32-224

LAND USE & DEVELOPMENT; STRUCTURES

pt. IIT

Permitted Sanitary Drainage Piping Materials for the Building

Sewer.

P-403.3 (relating to Materials—Sanitary Drainage and Vent Piping System Materi-
als—Building sewer pipe), Table P-403.3, is replaced with the following new Table P-403.3:

Table P-403.3

PERMITTED SANITARY DRAINAGE PIPING MATERIALS

FOR THE BUILDING SEWER
Material Standard (see Appendix A)
Acrylonitrile butadiene styrene ASTM D2661; ASTM D2751;
(ABS) Schedule 40 plastic pipe ASTM F628
(See Note a) (Type DWV)
Polyvinyl chloride (PVC) Schedule ASTM D2665; ASTM D2949;
40 plastic pipe (See Note a) (Type ASTM D3034; ASTM F891
DWYV, SDR26, SDR35, SDR41,
PS50, or PS100)
Cast iron, service weight bell and ASTM A74; CISPI 301
spigot
§ 32-225  Connection of the Building Sewer or Lateral to Sewer Main Pipe.

P-517.0 (relating to Joints and Connections—Joints Between Pipe and Fittings of Differ-
ent Material) is modified by adding the following new provisions P-517.7 and P-517.7.1:

P-517.7

Connection of the building sewer or lateral to sewer main pipe.

Connection of the sewer lateral to the sewer main shall be made with a saddle.
Saddle shall be installed on the upper quadrant of the sewer main pipe. The con-
necting spigot or hub shall be compatible with the pipe to which it is connected.

P-517.7.1  Saddle Specifications. Body of saddle shall be gray cast
iron, coated with a rust inhibitor paint, and correctly contoured for the pipe
to which it is to be installed. Saddle shall contain a rubber O-ring gasket,
ASTM C-361-77 or equal, cemented in place. Saddle shall have a spigot
or bell inlet suitable for acceptance for the type and size of the lateral pipe
to be connected. A fabricated stainless steel strap, of at least twenty-four
(24) gauge thickness, 2.5 wide, and containing two (2) each 0.375 stain-
less steel T-bolts and nuts shall be supplied for clamping the saddle to the
pipe. The saddle with coupling or gasket shall withstand at least seven
pounds per square inch (7 psi) internal pressure when installed. The sad-
dle shall be the type manufactured by The General Engineering Co.
(“GENECO”), P.O. Box 609, Frederick, Maryland 21701, as brand name



Ch. 32 PLUMBING 32-15

Sealtite Sewer Pipe Saddle, per Drawing R-3409-D2, a copy of which is
reproduced in Alburtis Codified Ordinances Chapter 32 Appendix § 32-H,
which is incorporated into this code by reference, or equivalent.

§ 32-226  Building (House) Traps.

P-1001.7 (relating to Traps, Interceptors, Separators, and Backwater Valves—Fixture
Traps —Building traps) is replaced in its entirety with the following new provisions P-1001.7 and
P-1001.7.1:

P-1001.7 Building (house) traps: An approved building (house) trap shall be
installed in each building (house) drain which is located below the basement floor.
The building (house) trap hall be installed below the basement floor, just inside the
foundation wall. There shall be a fresh air intake, for the fresh air entering the
building (house) drain, installed just inside of the inlet side of the trap. Refer to
the “Schematic Diagram of House Traps,” dated April 25, 1990, a copy of which is
reproduced in Alburtis Codified Ordinances Chapter 32 Appendix § 32-I, which is
incorporated into this code by reference. Building (house) traps may be installed
in any other location only after the approval of the Plumbing Inspector.

P-1001.7.1 Type and size of house traps and air inlets: The mini-
mum diameter of the house trap shall be the diameter of the pipe it traps,
but in no case less than four (4) inches. Air inlets shall be four (4) inches
in diameter for five (5) inch and six (6) inch drains, six (6) inches in di-
ameter for eight (8) inch drains, and a minimum diameter of eight (8)
inches for all larger drain sizes. Building (house) traps shall be of double
hub pattern with two (2) cleanouts, one (1) on each side of the trap.

§ 32-227  Location of Building Sewer Cleanouts.

P-1101.2 (relating to Drainage Pipe Cleanouts—Where Required —Building sewers) is
modified as follows:

All building sewers shall have cleanouts located not more than 100-feet (30480
mm) 50 feet (15240 mm) apart.

§ 32-228  Size of Floor Drains.

P-1211.3 (relating to Plumbing Fixtures —Flood Drains — Size of floor drains) is modified
as follows:

Floor drains shall be aminimum-of 2-inches—in-diameter of a size to serve effi-

ciently the purpose for which they are intended, and the floor drain trap and outlet
pipe shall be a minimum of three (3) inches in nominal diameter.




32-16 LAND USE & DEVELOPMENT; STRUCTURES pt. IIT

§ 32-229  No Floor Drains Below Grade.

P-1211.0 (relating to Plumbing Fixtures —Flood Drains) is modified by adding the fol-
lowing new provision P-1211.4:

P-1211.4 Not below grade: No floor drains shall be installed, or if existing,
either unplugged or otherwise made operative, in any building at or below the out-
side grade of the building.

§ 32-230 Floor Drains In Rooms With Urinals.

P-1218.0 (relating to Plumbing Fixtures— Urinals) is modified by adding the following
new provision P-1218.5:

P-1218.5 Floor drain: An approved floor drain shall be installed in any room
where a urinal is installed.

§ 32-231  Size of Water Service Pipe.

P-1502.1 (relating to Water Supply and Distribution—Water Service—Size of water
service pipe) is modified as follows:

The water service pipe shall be sized to supply water to the building in the quanti-
ties and at the pressures required in this code. The minimum diameter of water

service pipe shall be 3/4-ineh one (1) inch from the water main to the curb stop,
and from the curb stop to the water meter. Three methods for sizing the water

service pipe are described in Appendix C.

Article lll — DRBC Minimum
Water Conservation Performance Standards

§ 32-301 In General.

In addition to those changes set forth in Article II, the 1990 BOCA National Plumbing
Code is modified for purposes of the Plumbing Code of Borough of Alburtis as set forth in the
remaining sections of this Article III (with insertions indicated by double underlining and dele-
tions indicated by stricken-threugh type) in order to comply with requirements of the Delaware
River Basin Commission.



Ch. 32 PLUMBING 32-17

§ 32-302  General Policy.

No water shall be provided for internal or external use to any residential, commercial, in-
dustrial, agricultural, recreational, governmental, or public building or structure of any kind
which is constructed or remodeled and in which plumbing, water piping, or water fixtures are to
be installed, extended, or altered in any way, and for which construction a permit is required to
be obtained from the Borough of Alburtis (or would be required but for an exemption from a
permit requirement for public or governmental agencies) unless the new, extended, or altered
plumbing, water piping, and other water-using fixtures therein conform to the requirements and
standards set forth in this Article. The provisions of this Article shall apply to any such building
or structure for which such a building permit is issued, or would otherwise be required to be is-
sued but for such an exemption, on or after April 18, 1992.

§ 32-303  Approval of Urinals.

P-1218.1 (relating to Plumbing Fixtures — Urinals — Approval) is modified as follows:

Urinals shall conform to ANSI A112.19.2 listed in Appendix A. Theurinal-shall
use a maximum of 1 1/2 gallons (5.7 liters) of water per flushing cycle. Walter
consumption of urinals and associated flushing mechanisms shall not exceed an
average of 1.5 gallons per flush cycle over a range of test pressures from 20 to 80
psi. The fixtures shall perform and be tested in accordance with the hydraulic per-
formance and test requirements of ANST A112.19.2M and ANST A112.19.6M.

§ 32-304  Approval of Water Closets.

P-1219.1 (relating to Plumbing Fixtures —Water Closets— Approval) is modified as fol-
lows:

Water closets shall be of a water consumption type and conform to ASME/ANSI
A112.19.2 or ANSI Z124.4 listed in Appendix A. The water consumption of water
closets and associated flushing mechanisms shall not exceed an average of 1.6
gallons per flush cycle over a range of test pressures from 20 to 80 psi. The fix-
tures shall perform and be tested in accordance with the hydraulic performance and
test requirements of ANST A112.19.2M and ANSIT A112.19.6M.

§ 32-305 Maximum Flow of Building Water Distribution Sysetm.

P-1503.8 (relating to Water Supply and Distribution—Design of Building Water Distribu-
tion System—Maximum Flow), the portion before P-1503.8.1, is modified as follows:

Water outlets and/or adjacent fittings service showers, lavatories, kitchen sinks and

other sinks, and faucets, shall perform in accordance with the test requirements to
restrict and/or control the discharge flow rate to not more than 3 gallons per minute



32-18 LAND USE & DEVELOPMENT; STRUCTURES pt. IIT

(gpm) (11.3 Ipm) at over a range of test pressures from 20 to 80 psi (552 kPa),
when tested in accordance with American National Standards Institute (ANSI)

A112.18.1M. Lavatories in restrooms of public facilities shall be equipped with
standard valve or spring self-closing faucets with outlet devices limiting the flow
rate to a maximum of 0.5 gpm (1.9 Ipm) or self-closing metering valves limiting
the flow to 0.25 gallons (0.95 1) per cycle. All water closets shall use a maximum
of 4-gallens-153-1H 1.6 gallons of water per flushing cycle, as more fully set forth in
P-1219.1 of this Code, as amended by Codified Ordinances § 32-304. All urinals

shall use a maximum of 1 1/2 gallons (5.7 1) of water per flushing cycle, as more
fully set forth in P-1218.1 of this Code, as amended by Codified Ordinances § 32-
303.

§ 32-306  Special Purpose Equipment.

The performance standards set forth in this Article shall not apply to fixtures and fittings
such as emergency showers, aspirator faucets, and blowout fixtures that, in order to perform a
specialized function, cannot meet the specified standards.

§ 32-307 Exemptions.

Any person(s) may apply to the Plumbing Inspector of the Borough of Alburtis for an ex-
emption from the terms of this Article, upon proof that a substitute device, system, or procedure
will save as much or more water as the standards set forth in this Article, or that the person(s)
cannot comply with the standards set forth herein without undue hardship.

Article IV — Additional Borough Requirements

§ 32-401  Reports to Borough.

All plumbers licensed under this Chapter shall report to the Borough Secretary all im-
provements and additions made in the water arrangements of any premises in the Borough, and if
any plumber as aforesaid shall neglect or refuse to make such report, he or they shall, upon con-
viction, be subject to the penalties provided in this Article.



Ch. 32 PLUMBING 32-19

§ 32-402  Prohibited Work.

Any plumber or other person, excepting those chosen for that purpose, who shall introduce
a corporation stop into any public or private pipe, or form any connection or communication
whatever with such pipes, or break ground for that or any other similar purposes in the public
streets or alleys of the Borough, or introduce or use a corporation stop of a larger diameter than
is specified in his or their permits, shall, upon conviction, be subject, for each offense, to the
penalties provided in this Article.

§ 32-403  Violations and Penalties.

Any person who violates any provision of this Article shall, upon conviction thereof, be
punishable by a fine of not more than Three Hundred Dollars ($300.00) and costs of prosecution
or, upon default in payment of the fine and costs, by imprisonment in the county jail for a period
not to exceed thirty (30) days.

Appendix

9 32-A Disposition of Ordinance 275.

Ordinance 275 was never codified to the 1981 Code.

Ordinance 275 2003 Codified Ordinances
§1 § 32-102

§ 2 (repealer)

§3 Ch. 32, Art. II

§ 4 (saving clause)

§ 5 (effective date) § 32-203

9 32-B Disposition of Ordinance 291.

Ordinance 291 was never codified to the 1981 Code.

Ordinance 291 2003 Codified Ordinances
§1 § 32-302
§ 2(A) § 32-303
§ 2(B) § 32-304

§ 2(0C) § 32-305



32-20 LAND USE & DEVELOPMENT; STRUCTURES

Ordinance 291 2003 Codified Ordinances
§3(A) § 32-306

§ 3(B) § 32-307

§ 4 (repealer, severability, effec-

tive date)

9 32-C Disposition of Ordinance 342, § 9.

Ordinance 342 was never codified to the 1981 Code.

Ordinance 342 2003 Codified Ordinances
§ 9(a) § 32-208
§ 9(b) § 32-208

pt. IIT

932-D Disposition of 1981 Code, Chapter 133, Article VIII (derived from

Ordinance 203)
Ordinance 203 1981 Code 2003 Codified Ordinances
Art. VIII, § 1 § 133-15 Redundant with Ch. 32, Art II.
Art. VIII, § 2 § 133-16 § 32-401
Art. VIII, § 3 § 133-17 § 32-402
ArtIX, § 1 § 133-18 § 32-403
9 32-E Source Ordinances.
Ordinance 203 05-09-1979
Ordinance 215 11-11-1981
Ordinance 275 04-25-1990
Ordinance 283 01-09-1991
Ordinance 291 04-08-1992
Ordinance 342 12-30-1996
Ordinance 409 09-10-2003

Ordinance 415 10-29-2003



Ch. 32

9 32-F

Ordinance 157
Ordinance 159
Ordinance 163
Ordinance 175
Ordinance 180
Ordinance 191
Ordinance 199
Ordinance 265

9 32-G

PLUMBING 32-21

Prior Ordinances Concerning Related Subject Matter.

01-17-1972
07-03-1972
05-04-1973
10-08-1975
12-08-1976
04-12-1978
11-08-1978
12-14-1988

Disposition of Ordinance 199 to Chapter 92 of the 1981 Code
(before Ord. 275).

Chapter 92 of the 1981 Code was superseded by Ordinance 275. A copy of Chapter 92 as
in effect before Ordinance 275 is included with the CD-ROM and online versions of the Codified

Ordinances.

Ordinance 199

1981 Code, before Ord. 275

(intro) § 92-1
A-100.1 Not included
A-100.2 § 92-2(A)
A-100.3 § 92-2(B)
A-101.0 § 92-3
A-102.0 § 92-4
A-103.0 § 92-5
A-104.0 § 92-6
A-105.0 § 92-7
A-106.0 § 92-8
A-107.0 § 92-9
A-108.0 § 92-10
A-109.1 through A-109.5 § 92-11
A-110.0 §@2-12
A-111.0 § 92-13
A-112.0 § 92-14
A-113.0 § 92-15
A-114.0 § 92-16
A-115.0 § 92-17
A-116.0 § 92-18
A-117.0 § 92-19
A-118.0 § 92-20
A-119.0 § 92-21



32-22

Ordinance 199

A-120.0

A-121.0

A-122.0

A-123.0

A-124.0 (repealer)
A-125.0 (effective date)
A-126.1

A-126.2

A-126.3 (intro)

A-126.3 (remainder)

LAND USE & DEVELOPMENT; STRUCTURES

1981 Code, before Ord. 275

§ 92-22
§ 92-23
§92-24
§ 92-25

§ 92-26(A)
§ 92-26(B)
§ 92-26(C)
§ 92-27

pt. IIT



32-23

PLUMBING

ANY 4'OR 6" SCH. 40 LATERAL 4"OR 6" SCH. 40 PVC LATERAL

. 4"'= 4.50"

Crars ||.lo_o.|ﬂ = 6625 OO
L —— GASKETED PVC ADAPTER

_— ] ETED PVC_ADAPTER

SOLVEMT WELD_IN_FIELD

VIEW 1
MODEL "PvC40" OR "U40"

P |z 7 e N [ N e TSI 3
2 |
&
N ‘A
ASTM A—48 CLASS 30 CAST IRON PVC ADAPTER
||||| [ ASPHALTUM PAINT COATED .
I \ /
- N d
3 /)
ol T~ = g =T == —_ Z
K
3 NN ANl
Q - 2 .375"
g ™~ 2
€ > TYPE 303 =
v £ oR & Dia._1aP__| 7 STAINLESS STEEL |
v 4 . ' Z SWIVEL PIN - 1
E 4 ONLY FOR 6 PIPE N _ 7
(] 7
. 7, TYPE 18-8 [ [ I
n % STAINLESS STEEL NUTI | | | | .
4 SRAVITY % Smmm—— T T , _
z SEWER PIPE % Lo -
H /%)
= - o ———— — — R — [ |
" [ \\m [ 1 |
by 7 (I N
" 24 !
w 7 I |
W 7
" 74 A S.S. RIVET
y ! s mer
|
L

RS

Sealtite Sewer Pipe Saddles Drawing R-3409-D2.

3 X N
TINLET ToBOL |
SADDLE _SIZE zoomrn iy ) \Wﬂ_ﬁv VIEW 2 VIEW 3 '
ST T [t 1w %] MODEL 'PVC40P" " " OR "UA0A
E G “cm... mm%ou.. 4= m.w PvC .wwm‘ *monou. ) m b MODEL "PVC40A" OR 'U40A
U .00"[7-18. U . 00" [ 7—
B e e OR "U40F"
4 U 3. N 4.80" - N 3. N - N =
o st e
4 x 137118507 |7-43 U 513" =
4 X L wwo,. mw anq X U ,c.vw w.gn .wn u QHZWOO
[N 507 [22.50°|7=52. LG U 50 [23.00{7=
10 U 2.507125°00" 72253 e v 3.00 125507 [7-61.5 SEALTITE SEWER PIPE SADDLES ot Cimem, CrotemeC CO
LM U 5 750 [7—68.56 | C U 550 [27.75|7-69 plorihienges
216 U 750 13000 17-76 e 775 [30.00°17-76 NOTE - THIS DWG. SUPERSEDES R-3409-D1 rrE—
s —
mm———(Rr-3109 L2

Ch. 32
9 32-H



32-24 LAND USE & DEVELOPMENT; STRUCTURES pt. IIT

9 32-1 Schematic Diagram of House Traps.

SCHEMATIC DIAGRAM OF HOUSE TRAP

FOR PLUMBING CODE OF THE BOROUGH OF ALBURTIS
DATE: APRIL 25, 1990. BY: PAUL D. NORTH, JR.
RE: SECTION P-1001.7 BUILDING (HOUSE) TRAPS

FRESH AIR
INLET

NOTE: BUILDING (HOUSE) TRAPS MUST BE INSTALLED
BELOW THE BASEMENT FLOOR.

BUILDING
4 LINE
CLEANOUTS
_EXTEND UP
TO FLOOR

BASEMENT FLOOR . \\L

l
] | ‘ _._J( :
[/ - PIPE ) ' ‘ff-‘ o T—d

L T L T

7 SANITARY "TEE"________T ’

"DOUBLE HUB"
HOUSE TRAP

“WYE" &
1/8 BEND

/”I/
ALTERNATE ARRANGEMENT RETURN BEND

ALL OTHER PARTS ARE IDENTICAL. VNMZ%ZKQQT;j?

~
-+
b 4
L)
-
¢
-
/l

S



